MINUTES REGULAR OPEN MEETING

UNOFFICIAL COPY OF THE BOARD OF EDUCATION
DATE: TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 25, 2018 PLACE: ADMINISTRATION OFFICE
TIME: 7:00 P.M. 1881 DEER PARK AVENUE
2018-2019-05 DEER PARK,NY 11729
MEMBERS PRESENT: Mr. Al Centamore

Ms. Donna Gulli Grunseich
Mr. Robert Marino

Mr. Keith Rooney

Mrs. Kristine Rosales

EXCUSED: Mr. John Gouskos, President
Mrs. Donna Marie Elliott, Vice President

STAFF PRESENT: Ms. Eva Demyen, Superintendent
Ms. Marguerite Jimenez, Asst. Superintendent
Mr. James Cummings, Asst. Superintendent
Ms. Laura Ferrugiari, Attorney
Ms. Lisa Brennan, District Clerk

Upon a motion by Mr. Centamore, seconded by Mrs. Rosales, a regular meeting of the Board of
Education was convened at 7:00 p.m.

Upon a motion by Ms.Gulli Grunseich, seconded by Mr. Marino, the Board of Education
adjourned for an Executive Session at 7:02 p.m. to discuss a residency matter. The Board of
Education reconvened at 8:00 p.m. into Open Session.

APPROVAL

OF MINUTES Upon a motion by Mr. Marino, seconded by Mr. Centamore,
the Board of Education made the necessary corrections and
moved for the approval of the Minutes from the Open
Meeting on August 21, 2018 and the work session of
September 4, 2018.

PRESENTATION:
SLIDESHOW ON
SUMMER PROJECTS
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NEW BUSINESS

SECOND READING

AND APPROVAL
OF POLICIES

DISPOSAL OF
OVENS AT THE
DEER PARK
HIGH SCHOOL

APPROVAL OF
STIPULATION
OF SETTLEMENT

APPROVAL OF
REVISED
2018-2019
CSEA PAID
HOLIDAY
CALENDAR

APPROVAL OF
2018-2019
CO-CURRICULAR
LIST

Upon a motion by Mr. Centamore, seconded by Mr. Rooney, the Board of
Education unanimously approved the following Resolution:

RESOLVED, that the Board of Education approve the following policies
as accepted and adopted by the Board of Education and placed in the
Board of Education Policy Manual.

» #0115 - Student Harassment and Bullying Prevention and Intervention
» #6510 - Online Banking Services

Upon a motion by Mrs. Rosales, seconded by Ms. Gulli Grunseich, the
Board of Education unanimously approved the following Resolution:

RESOLVED, that the Board of Education approve the disposal of the
below listed ovens at the DPHS that have been discontinued and
replacement parts are not readily available.

> 2 - Whirlpool ovens, Super Capacity 465

Upon a motion by Ms. Gulli Grunseich, seconded by Mrs. Rosales, the
Board of Education unanimously approved the following Resolution:

RESOLVED, that the Board of Education of the Deer Park Union Free school
District (“District”) hereby approves the terms and conditions of the
Stipulation of Settlement dated August 28, 2018, resolving an Improper
Practice Charge No. U-35835 filed by the Deer Park Administrators
Association on behalf of Gina Palasciano; and

FURTHER RESOLVED, that the Board of Education authorizes the
Superintendent of Schools to execute the stipulation of settlement as
approved on the District’s behallf.

Upon a motion by Ms. Gulli Grunseich, seconded by Mr. Marino, the
Board of Education unanimously approved the following Resolution:

RESOLVED, that the Board of Education approve the REVISED 2018-2019
CSEA Paid Holiday calendar dated September 5, 2018.

Upon a motion by Mr. Centamore, seconded by Mrs. Rosales, the Board
of Education unanimously approved the following Resolution:

RESOLVED, that the Board of Education approve the following co-
curricular list for the 2018-2019 school year.

HIGH SCHOOL
ACTIVITY/CLUB NAME EXP. | UNITS AMOUNT
Academic Team Matthew Murphy 5+ 5 $ 3,334.75
Art Club Joseph Mucci 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
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Catapault Team Bruce Sander 4 2 1,028.58
Chamber Ensemble - Chorus Catherine Lubrano 5+ 4.5 3,001.28
Chamber Ensemble - Orchestra Kathryn Attard 5+ 5 3,334.75
Chess & Mind Games Victor LoMonaco 5+ 2 1,333.90
Class Advisors - Freshman Sara DiCandia 1 2 1,028.58
Marissa Caruso 1 2 1,028.58
Class Advisors - Junior Edward Johntry 5+ 4.5 3,001.28
Desiree LaCova 5 4.5 3,001.28
Class Advisor - Senior Beth McCourt 5+ 12 8,003.40
Class Advisors - Sophomore Jenine Moran 5+ 3 2,000.85
Laurie Osbern 5+ 3 2,000.85
Christine
Community Service DiProperzio 5+ 3 2,000.85
Cornerstone Noel Skelton 5+ 3 2,000.85
DECA Gregory Menig 5+ 3 2,000.85
Environmental Club Francis Amendola 5+ 3 2,000.85
Extra Curricular Acct. Treasurer Gregory Menig 5+ 8 5,335.60
Gay/Straight Alliance Kristen Wallace 5+ 1.5 1,000.43
Christine Harbison 5+ 1.5 1,000.43
International Culture Club Alfonsina Sguera 5+ 1.5 1,000.43
Josephine Conway 5+ 1.5 1,000.43
Jazz Ensemble - Band Jerry Cannarozzo 5+ 7 4,668.65
Literary Magazine Scott Carney 5+ 3 2,000.85
Marching Band Director Jerry Cannarozzo 5+ 8 5,335.60
Math Team Kevin McCreesh 5+ 5 3,334.75
Mock Trial Brittany O'Brian 1 3 1,542.87
Musical Conductor Scott Abrams 5+ 5.66 3,774.94
Musical Stage Director Kristen Wallace 5+ 8 5,335.60
Musical Stage Director Asst. Catherine Lubrano 5+ 5 3,334.75
National Honor Society Seth Margolin 5+ 4 2,667.80
Newspaper Club Christine Murphy 5+ 3.5 2,334.33
Luciana Restivo 5+ 3.5 2,334.33
Patriot Club Laurie Osbern 5+ 3 2,000.85
Pen Society Teresa Greco Tarello 5+ 3 2,000.85
Play Co-Directors - Fall Michael Moriarty 5+ 4 2,667.80
Catherine Lubrano 5+ 4 2,667.80
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Play Director - Winter Kristen Wallace 5+ 8 $ 5,335.60
Red Cross Club Victor LoMonaco 5+ 2 $ 1,333.90
Resident Lighting Technician Scott Abrams 5+ 4 $ 2,667.80
Robotics TBD 5
S.A.D.D. Karen Haar 1 3 $ 1,542.87
Stage Crew Director Alex Mesimeris 5+ 10 $ 6,669.50
STEP TBD 3
Student Activities Director Brian Kruger 5+ 6 $ 4,001.70
Student Council Advisors Rachel Glaubach 2 4 $ 2,057.16
Jessica Negron 1 4 $ 2,057.16
Varsity Leaders Club Brian Tower 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
World Language Honor Society Josephine Conway 5+ 2 $ 1,333.90
Dina Pannone 5+ 4 $ 2,667.80
Yearbook Justin Gutman 5+ 9 $ 6,002.55
TOTAL HS $ 135,112.16
ROBERT FROST
ACTIVITY/CLUB NAME EXP. | UNITS AMOUNT
Anime Club Lisa McQuilkin 1 1 $ 514.29
Art Innovators Maria Giglio 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Audio Visual Assistant Scott Surdi 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Chamber Ensemble - Chorus Youngsun Koh-Lee 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Chamber Ensemble - Orchestra Maria Wingert 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Drama Club Director Michael Moriarty 5+ 4 $ 2,667.80
Drama Club Stage Director Maria Giglio 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Fashion Club Cindy Adriaenssens 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Golf Club Douglas Hecker 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Homework Club Denise Black S5+ 6 $ 4,001.70
Internet Club Susan Pannell 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Jazz Ensemble Band Michael Livorno 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Math Team Cindy Jewell 5+ 5 $ 3,334.75
Mind Blasters J. Scott Newman 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
National Jr. Honor Society Seth Margolin 5+ 4 $ 2,667.80
Newspaper Club Kathy Leibow 4 2 $ 1,028.58
Tom LoCascio 5+ 2 $ 1,333.90
Robotics Club Scott Surdi 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
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Science & Environmental Club Dawn Ferro 5 3 $ 2,000.85
Social Studies Club Kevin Auer 5 3 $ 2,000.85
Step Squad Amina Kennedy 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Student Activity Treasurer Cindy Jewell 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Student Council Advisors Dani Iadevaia 4 3 $ 1,542.87
Denise Tassey 4 3 $ 1,542.87

World of Difference Stephanie O'Connell 1 2 $ 1,028.58
Variety Show Director Melissa Cangelosi 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Variety Show Tech Director Scott Surdi 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Writers Club Viviane Tzoumas 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Yearbook Scott Surdi 5+ 2.5 $ 1,667.38
Melissa Cangelosi 5+ 2.5 $ 1,667.38

TOTAL RF $ 59,013.19

JOHN F. KENNEDY
ACTIVITY/CLUB NAME EXP. | UNITS AMOUNT

Advanced Band Louis Nicolosi 5+ 8 $ 5,335.60
Art & Literary Club Joseph Mucci 5+ 2 $ 1,333.90
Jessica Kalisiewicz 5+ 2 $ 1,333.90

Cadet Band - 1/2 yr. Gregg Romano 5+ 4 $ 2,667.80
Chamber Orchestra - 4th & 5th Grade -%2yr | Kathryn Attard 5+ 4 $ 2,667.80
Chorus - 3rd Grade Kristen Lombardo 5+ 8 $ 5,335.60
Chorus - 4th & 5th Grade Kristen Lombardo 5+ 8 $ 5,335.60
Computer Coding Audrey Schulter 4 2 $ 1,028.58
Gifted and Talented Lauren King 1 3 $ 1,542.87
Intramural Club Eileen Tuozzo 5 1.5 $ 1,000.43
Let's Make a Difference Jacqueline Amato 5+ 1.5 $ 1,000.43
Joyce Carmen 5+ 1.5 $ 1,000.43

Math Olympiad Lisa Baker 4 3 $ 1,542.87
Musical Theater Club Michael Capobianco 2 2 $ 1,028.58
Lori Palopoli 5+ 2 $ 1,333.90

Orchestra Kathryn Attard 5+ 8 $ 5,335.60
Science Enrichment Club Jason Ranghelli 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Student Government Club Patricia Katz 4 3 $ 1,542.87
Technology/AV Club Lori Palopoli 5+ 4 $ 2,667.80
Variety Show Donna Arena 5+ 1 $ 666.95
Melissa Price 5+ 1 $ 666.95

Suzanne Wright 5+ 1 $ 666.95
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Yoga Michelle Cangelosi 5+ 1.5 $ 1,000.43

TOTAL JFK $ 48,036.67

JOHN Q. ADAMS

ACTIVITY/CLUB NAME EXP. | UNITS AMOUNT
Art & Literature Club Denise Vadala 5+ 2.25 $ 1,500.64
Fitness Club Caryn Kaplan 5+ 2.25 $ 1,500.64
Music Club Matthew Spataro 5+ 2.25 $ 1,500.64
Newspaper Club Marcella Biordi 1 2.25 $ 1,157.15

TOTAL JQA $ 5,659.07

MAY MOORE
ACTIVITY/CLUB NAME EXP. | UNITS AMOUNT
Music Club Kristen Lombardo 5+ 3 $ 2,000.85
Newspaper Club Danielle Finocchiaro 3 3 $ 1,542.87
STEAM Club Susan Steinman 1 3 $ 1,542.87
TOTAL MM $ 5,086.59
GRAND
TOTAL $  252,907.68
APPROVAL
OF Upon a motion by Mr. Marino, seconded by Ms. Gulli Grunseich,

SCHEDULES the Board of Education unanimously approved the following
Schedules collectively:

NON-INSTRUCTIONAL

SCHEDULE -- CS --CHANGE OF SALARY/ STATUS (Non-Instructional)

Leyda Juergensen
Robert Frost Middle School

Position: 6 hr. Non-Instructional Aide
Salary/Step:  $19.11/hr
Effective 9/1/2018

CHANGE from 3 hr Aide at JQA to 6 hr Aide at RF

Gilberto Vazquez

Robert Frost Middle School

Position: Night Custodian

Salary/Step: $48,640 Step 1

Effective 9/1/2018

CHANGE from Night Custodial Aide to Night Custodian (Salary prorated
at $40,221.54)

SCHEDULE -- NN --APPOINTMENTS (Non-Instructional)

AnneMarie Dawson
Robert Frost Middle School

Position: 6 hr. Non-Instructional Aide
Salary/Step:  $17.11/hour
Effective 9/12/2018
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Kirstyn Dunn
John Quincy Adams School

Position: 6 hour Non-Instructional Aide
Salary/Step:  $19.11/hour

Effective 9/1/2018

Edward Lippert

Transportation

Position: Bus Driver

Salary/Step:  $24.76/hour

Effective 8/29/2018

Eileen Lock

Transportation

Position: Bus Driver

Salary/Step:  $24.76/hour

Effective 8/29/2018

Tricia Oliveri

May Moore School

Position: Non-Instructional 3 hr Cafeteria Aide
Salary/Step:  $17.11/hour

Effective 9/1/2018

Tracie Reina
John Quincy Adams School

Position: 3 hr Non-Instructional Cafeteria Aide
Salary/Step:  $17.11/hour
Effective 9/17/2018

Jennifer Rivela
John F Kennedy Intermediate School

Position: Non-Instructional 3 hr Cafeteria Aide
Salary/Step:  $17.11/hr
Effective 9/1/2018

Megan Rooney-Merkle
John Quincy Adams School

Position: 3 hr Non-Instructional Cafeteria Aide
Salary/Step:  $17.11/hour
Effective 9/17/2018

SCHEDULE -- 00 --RESIGNATIONS / RETIREMENTS / REMOVALS / TERMINATIONS
(Non-Instructional)

Rosalyn Baskin

Transportation

Position: Transportation Aide
Salary/Step:

Effective 9/1/2018

Resignation for the purpose of RETIREMENT. No outstanding obligation
to the district.

Kirstyn Dunn
John F Kennedy Intermediate School

Position: Cafeteria Aide
Salary/Step:
Effective 8/31/2018

Resignation to accept 6 hr position at JQA
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Pearl Rogers

Transportation

Position: Transportation Aide
Salary/Step:

Effective 9/1/2018

Removal. No outstanding obligation to the district.

John Warner

Transportation

Position: Bus Driver
Salary/Step:

Effective 8/28/2018

Resignation. No outstanding obligation to the district.

SCHEDULE -- --LEAVES OF ABSENCE (Non-Instructional
Danielle Aiken
District Office
Position: Non-Instructional Aide
Salary/Step:
Effective 8/20/2018-8/24/2018
Paid Medical LOA (FMLA)
Michael McEvoy
Memorial
Position: Groundsman
Salary/Step:
Effective 8/18/2018-10/26/2018

Extension of Unpaid Medical LOA (WC)

Dennis McNeil
John Quincy Adams School

Position: Custodian (split shift)
Salary/Step:

Effective 10/10/2018-10/17/2018
Paid Medical LOA (FMLA)

Bunnie Smith

Transportation

Position: Bus Driver

Salary/Step:

Effective 9/16/2018-10/15/2018

Extension of Unpaid Medical LOA (WC)

Lionel Victor

Memorial

Position: Maintenance Crew Leader
Salary/Step:

Effective 9/17/2018-9/24/2018
Paid Medical LOA (FMLA)

Davis Wong

Robert Frost Middle School

Position: Day Custodian
Salary/Step:

Effective 10/15/2018-11/19/2018
10/15/18-10/25/18 Paid LOA (FMLA) 10/26/18-11/19/18 Unpaid
LOA (FMLA)
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SCHEDULE -- TPA --TEMPORARY ASSIGNMENT (Non-Instructional

Patti Maurio

Deer Park High School

Position: Regents Exam Proctor
Salary/Step:  $19.11/hour

Effective 8/16/2018-8/17/2018
Marie Untener

Deer Park High School

Position: Regents Exam Proctor
Salary/Step:  $18.11/hour

Effective 8/16/2018-8/17/2018

SCHEDULE -- TRN --TRANSFERS (Non-Instructional

Josephine Calder
Robert Frost Middle School

Position: Non-Instructional Aide
Salary/Step:
Effective 9/17/2018

Transfer from May Moore to Robert Frost

Janice Crandall

Transportation

Position: Transportation Aide
Salary/Step:

Effective 9/1/2018

Transfer from St. Cyril's to Transportation

INSTRUCTIONAL

SCHEDULE -- CSS --CHANGE OF STATUS / SALARY (Instructional

Robert D'Agostino

Deer Park High School

Position: Driver Education Instructor
Salary/Step:  $50/hour

Effective 9/1/2018

Salary Increase

Marianna Grieco
John Quincy Adams School

Position: .6 Math Coach

Salary/Step:  No Change

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Christina Niebling

District Wide

Position: .6 Speech Teacher

Salary/Step: $96,000 MA75/Step 16
Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

CHANGED from .4 to .6 (S.Mirman - St. Cyril's) Salary prorated at $58,037
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Keri Schumacher

Deer Park High School

Position: JV Girls Soccer Coach

Salary/Step: $4,742.76 8 Units/Step 5+
Effective 8/27/2018-11/1/2018

Change of Dates (reduced by one week)

SCHEDULE -- L --PART-TIME APPOINTMENTS (Instructional

Doreen Bellantoni

District Wide

Position: .4 Speech Teacher

Salary/Step: $61,985 MA/Step 1
Effective 9/17/2018-6/30/2019

Salary prorated at $23,926.21

Melissa Brookmeyer
Robert Frost Middle School

Position: .5 Special Education Teacher
Salary/Step: $61,985 MA/Step 1
Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

.3 RF/.2 HS Salary prorated at $30,993

Jessica Sharpe
Robert Frost Middle School

Position: .4 ELA Teacher
Salary/Step: $61,985 MA/Step 1
Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Split RF/HS Salary prorated at $24,794

Barbara Spreen
John Quincy Adams School

Position: .6 Elementary Teacher
Salary/Step: $61,985 MA/Step 1
Effective 9/18/2018-6/30/2019

Salary prorated at $35,703 (Grieco)

Oscar Villalobos

Deer Park High School

Position: .8 Spanish Teacher
Salary/Step: $56,707 BA/Step 1
Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

4 HS/.4 RF Salary prorated at $45,365

SCHEDULE -- LR --LONG TERM SUBSTITUTE / LEAVE REPLACEMENT (LR)
APPOINTMENTS (Instructional

Doreen Bellantoni

May Moore School

Position: .6 Leave Replacement Speech Teacher
Salary/Step: $61,985 MA/Step 1
Effective 9/17/2018-6/30/2019

(Mirman) Salary prorated at $35,889.32

Andrea Farina

Deer Park High School

Position: Leave Replacement Earth Science Teacher
Salary/Step: $61,985 MA/Step 1

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

(Branca)
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Adriana Gonzalez

Deer Park High School

Position: Leave Replacement Spanish Teacher
Salary/Step: $61,985 MA/Step 1
Effective 9/1/2018-1/30/2019

(Nola) Salary prorated at $30,683

SCHEDULE -- N --PROBATIONARY TEACHER (Instructional) *

Daniel Franco

May Moore School

Position: Special Education Teacher
Salary/Step:

Effective 9/1/2016 -8/31/2020

REVISED TENURE DATE: SEPTEMBER 1, 2020

*Except to the extent required by the applicable provisions of Education Law 2509, 2573, 3212 and 3014, in order to be granted
tenure the classroom teacher or building administrator shall have received composite or overall annual professional performance
review ratings pursuant to Education Law 3012-c and/or 3012-d of either effective or highly effective in at least three (3) of the
four (4) preceding years and if the classroom teacher or administrator receives an ineffective composite or overall rating in the
final year of the probationary period he or she shall not be eligible for tenure at that time.

SCHEDULE -- NAS --ADMINSTRATIVE / SUPERVISORY APPOINTMENTS (Instructional)*

Christine Gill

District Wide

Position: Probationary Curriculum Associate for Secondary Math
& Business Gr 6-12

Salary/Step:  $113,000

Effective 8/27/2018-8/26/2022

*Except to the extent required by the applicable provisions of Education Law 2509, 2573, 3212 and 3014, in order to be granted
tenure the classroom teacher or building administrator shall have received composite or overall annual professional performance
review ratings pursuant to Education Law 3012-c and/or 3012-d of either effective or highly effective in at least three (3) of the
four (4) preceding years and if the classroom teacher or administrator receives an ineffective composite or overall rating in the
final year of the probationary period he or she shall not be eligible for tenure at that time.

SCHEDULE -- NPS --PER DIEM SUBSTITUTES (Instructional

Jonas Garelle

District Wide

Position: Per-Diem Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:  $110/day

Effective 9/19/2018

Certification: Physical Education

Jennifer Hauk

District Wide

Position: Per-Diem Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:  $110/day

Effective 9/22/2018

Reinstate as a per-diem substitute

Joseph Pagano

District Wide

Position: Per-Diem Substitute Teaching Assistant
Salary/Step:  $90/day

Effective 9/28/2018
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SCHEDULE -- NS --PERMANENT SUBSTITUTES (Instructional

Andrea Accomando

May Moore School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:  $125/day

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Certifications: Childhood Ed 1-6, Early Childhood Ed B-2

Stephanie Acierno

Deer Park High School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:  $125/day

Effective 9/1/2018 -6/30/2019

Certifications: ELA 5-6, ELA 7-12

Melissa Brookmeyer

Deer Park High School

Position: .5 Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:  $125/day

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Salary prorated at $62.50/day

Danielle Calcagno
Robert Frost Middle School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:  $125/day
Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Certification: Math 7-12 (pending)

Jessica Campisi
John F Kennedy Intermediate School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:  $125/day
Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Certification: Childhood Ed Gr 1-6

Katie Drab

John F Kennedy Intermediate School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:  $125/day

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Certification: Childhood Ed Gr 1-6 (pending)

Jennifer Johnson

Deer Park High School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:  $125/day

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Certification: Social Studies 7-12

Nicole Leggio

John Quincy Adams School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:  $125/day

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Certifications: Students w Dis Gr 1-6, Childhood Ed Gr 1-6
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Patricia Richter
John F Kennedy Intermediate School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:  $125/day
Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Certifications: Pre K-6, ENL K-12, Students w/ Dis K-6, Business & Marketing

Jessica Sharpe
Robert Frost Middle School

Position: .6 Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:  $125/day
Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Salary prorated at $75/day

Oscar Villalobos

Deer Park High School

Position: .2 Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:  $125/day

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Salary prorated at $25/day

SCHEDULE -- O --RESIGNATIONS / RETIREMENTS / REMOVALS / TERMINATIONS
(Instructional)

Krystal Hoffman

Robert Frost Middle School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:

Effective 8/23/2018

Resignation. No outstanding obligation to the district.

Jessica Hucke
John F Kennedy Intermediate School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:
Effective 8/30/2018

Resignation. No outstanding obligation to the district.

Jennifer Johnson

Deer Park High School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:

Effective 9/7/2018

Resignation. No outstanding obligation to the district.

Marie Loeffel

Robert Frost Middle School

Position: Teaching Assistant

Salary/Step:

Effective 9/4/2018

Resignation. No outstanding obligation to the district.

Joseph Pagano

Deer Park High School

Position: Teaching Assistant

Salary/Step:

Effective 9/24/2018

Resignation. No outstanding obligation to the district.
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Ronald Rudaitis
John Quincy Adams School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:
Effective 8/30/2018

Resignation. No outstanding obligation to the district.

Alexandra Santora
Robert Frost Middle School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:
Effective 8/30/2018

Resignation. No outstanding obligation to the district.

Magdalena Stovickova

Deer Park High School

Position: Girls Varsity Swim Head Coach
Salary/Step:

Effective 8/31/2018

Resignation. No outstanding obligation to the district.

Tara Ann Yoches

Deer Park High School

Position: PT .8 Spanish Teacher/.2 Leave Replacement Spanish
Teacher/.2 Permanent Substitute

Salary/Step:

Effective 8/20/2018

Resignation. No outstanding obligation to the district.

SCHEDULE -- Q --LEAVES OF ABSENCE (Instructional
Aida Buckley
St. Cyril
Position: Teaching Assistant
Salary/Step:
Effective 9/10/2018-11/30/2018

9/10/18-10/1/18 Paid FMLA 10/2/18-11/30/18 Unpaid FMLA

Anthony Cinquemani

Deer Park High School

Position: Math Teacher
Salary/Step:

Effective 9/12/2018-9/21/2018

Paid Paternity Leave (FMLA)

Lorrie Cook

May Moore School

Position: Teaching Assistant
Salary/Step:

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Intermittent LOA FMLA (Caretaker)

Lisa Feingold-Smith
Robert Frost Middle School

Position: Physical Education Teacher
Salary/Step:

Effective 9/4/2018 -10/26/2018
Paid Medical LOA (FMLA)
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James Henry
Robert Frost Middle School

Position: Associate Principal
Salary/Step:
Effective 9/12/2018-10/18/2018

9/12/18-9/26/18 Paid Paternity Leave FMLA 9/27/18-10/18/18 Paid FMLA

Vanessa Pizzo
John Quincy Adams School

Position: ENL Teacher
Salary/Step:
Effective 9/4/2018-10/5/2018

CHANGE of DATES for Paid Maternity LOA (FMLA)

Jaclyn Stein
John Quincy Adams School

Position: Special Education Teacher
Salary/Step:
Effective 11/4/2018-2/8/2019

11/4/18-12/21/18 Paid Maternity LOA (FMLA) 12/22/18-2/8/19
Unpaid Remainder of FMLA

Donna Tenaglia
John Quincy Adams School

Position: Teaching Assistant
Salary/Step:
Effective 9/4/2018 -10/19/2018

Unpaid Medical LOA

Keri Zuk

John F Kennedy Intermediate School
Position: Physical Education Teacher
Salary/Step:

Effective 9/4/2018-10/12/2018

CHANGE of DATES for Paid Maternity Sick LOA (FMLA)

SCHEDULE -- TA --PROBATIONARY TEACHING ASSISTANT (Instructional

Christine LaCascia
Robert Frost Middle School

Position: Probationary Teaching Assistant
Salary/Step:  $29,366.98
Effective 9/1/2018 -8/31/2022

SCHEDULE -- TR --TRANSFERS (Instructional

Erica Fulgenzi
John Quincy Adams School

Position: Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:
Effective 9/4/2018-10/5/2018

Temporary transfer from MM to JQA (Pizzo)

Kathleen Ohanian

Deer Park High School

Position: Teaching Assistant
Salary/Step:

Effective 9/1/2018

Transfer from JFK to HS
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Amy Pellegrino
John F Kennedy Intermediate School

Position: .2 Permanent Substitute Teacher
Salary/Step:
Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Transfer from HS to JFK (Permanent Substitute position)

SCHEDULE -- TTPA --TEMPORARY ASSIGNMENT (Instructional)

Stephen Bertelle

May Moore School

Position: Extra Care Stipend
Salary/Step:  $4,227

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Lauren Boncimino
Robert Frost Middle School

Position: Extra Care Stipend
Salary/Step:  $4,227

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019
Drusilla Bond

Deer Park High School

Position: Regents Exam Proctor
Salary/Step:  $20.98/hour

Effective 8/16/2018-8/17/2018
Joseph Buscarino

Deer Park High School

Position: Regents Exam Proctor
Salary/Step:  $39/hour

Effective 8/16/2018-8/17/2018
Lori Cook

May Moore School

Position: Extra Care Stipend
Salary/Step:  $4,227

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Joanne Frias
Robert Frost Middle School

Position: Extra Care Stipend
Salary/Step:  $4,227

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019
Barbara Goemans

May Moore School

Position: Extra Care Stipend
Salary/Step:  $4,227

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Jillian Jacinth

Deer Park High School

Position: Girls Varsity Swim Head Coach
Salary/Step: $4,525.75 Units/Step 4
Effective 9/1/2018-11/2/2018

Replacing M. Stovickova for the remainder of the swim season
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Amina Kennedy

Deer Park High School

Position: ELA Regents Grader
Salary/Step:  $71/hour

Effective 8/16/2018-8/20/2018
Lisa Kiernan

Deer Park High School

Position: ELA Regents Grader
Salary/Step:  $71/hour

Effective 8/16/2018-8/20/2018
Desiree LaCova

Deer Park High School

Position: ELA Regents Grader
Salary/Step:  $71/hour

Effective 8/16/2018-8/20/2018

Thomas Leonick
John F Kennedy Intermediate School

Position: Extra Care Stipend

Salary/Step:  $4,227

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019

Amanda Luciano

Deer Park High School

Position: JV Girls Soccer Coach

Salary/Step: $457.15 7 Units/Step 2
Effective 8/20/2018-8/24/2018

Coverage for Keri Schumacher (one week)

Angela Macaluso

Deer Park High School

Position: Regents Exam Proctor
Salary/Step:  $20.98/hour

Effective 8/16/2018-8/17/2018
Kevin McCreesh

Deer Park High School

Position: Regents Exam Proctor
Salary/Step:  $39/hour

Effective 8/16/2018-8/17/2018
Katelyn O'Brien

Deer Park High School

Position: Regents Exam Proctor
Salary/Step:  $39/hour

Effective 8/16/2018-8/17/2018

Cassie Patterson

Deer Park High School

Position: JV Cheerleading Coach
Salary/Step: $2,571.45
Effective 8/20/2018-11/1/2018

John Pawelko

5 Units/Step 1

Deer Park High School

Position: Girls Varsity Assistant Swim Coach
Salary/Step: $3,291.46 8 Units/Step 1
Effective 9/1/2018-11/2/2018
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Luciana Restivo

Deer Park High School

Position: ELA Regents Grader
Salary/Step:  $71/hour

Effective 8/16/2018-8/20/2018

Elena Scaglione
John F Kennedy Intermediate School

Position: Summer School Substitute Teaching Assistant

Salary/Step:  $12.86/hour
Effective 7/9/2018 - 8/17/2019

Dianne Schuster
John Quincy Adams School

Position: Extra Care Stipend
Salary/Step:  $4,227

Effective 9/1/2018-6/30/2019
Christopher Thomson

Deer Park High School

Position: Regents Exam Proctor
Salary/Step:  $39/hour

Effective 8/16/2018-8/17/2018

Billie Jo Vozza

Deer Park High School

Position: Regents Exam Proctor
Salary/Step:  $20.98/hour

Effective 8/16/2018-8/17/2018

General* #7
Federal* #4
Capital® #5
Capital® #6
School Lunch* #3
Daily Check
WORKERS' COMP.* Register
Daily Check
WORKERS' COMP.* Register
Daily Check
WORKERS' COMP.* Register
Daily Check
WORKERS' COMP.* Register
General* #5
General* #38
Federal* #3
Federal* #5
Capital® #7
Capital® #8
School Lunch* #4
Trust & Agency* #2
Daily Check
WORKERS' COMP.* Register
Daily Check
WORKERS' COMP.* Register
Daily Check
WORKERS' COMP.* Register
Daily Check
WORKERS' COMP.* Register
General #11
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8/31/2018
8/31/2018
8/31/2018
8/31/2018
8/31/2018

8/17/2018

8/17/2018

8/17/2018

8/17/2018
8/31/2018
9/30/2018
8/31/2018
9/30/2018
9/30/2018
9/30/2018
9/30/2018
8/31/2018

8/24/2018

8/24/2018

8/27/2018

829//2018
9/30/2018
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General #12 9/30/2018

Federal #6 9/30/2018

Capital #9 9/30/2018

Capital #10 9/30/2018

School Lunch #5 9/30/2018
Daily Check

WORKERS' COMP. Register 9/11/2018
Daily Check

WORKERS' COMP. Register 9/12/2018
Daily Check

WORKERS' COMP. Register 9/17/2018
Daily Check

WORKERS' COMP. Register 9/18/2018

SCHEDULE D - BID

Bids for Bid # BDP18-018 Frost Softball Uniforms and Boys Basketball Shorts were received and
opened at 11:00 AM on August 30, 2018.

Bids were advertised in Newsday. Forms and specifications were processed in accordance with
Section 103 of the General Municipal Law and bids were solicited on the Empire State
Purchasing Group website at www.EmpireStateBidSystem.com.

Bids were received from the following vendors:

BSN Sports, Passon’s Sports and US Games Items 1 and 2: $2040.00
Items 3 and 4: No Bid
Legacy Sports, Inc. Items 1 and 2: $1889.40
Items 3 and 4: No Bid
New York State Industries for the Disabled Items 1 and 2: $1914.00
Items 3 and 4: No Bid
Port Jefferson Sports Items 1 and 2: $2184.90
Items 3 and 4: No Bid
Riddell/All American Items 1 and 2: $3870.00

Items 3 and 4: $ 972.00
Present at bid opening: Lauren von Ende, Purchasing Agent and Linda Martinez, Recorder. There
were no vendors present.

It is recommended that the bid be awarded to the following vendors as the lowest responsible
bidders meeting specifications:

New York State Industries for the Disabled Items 1 and 2: $1914.00
Riddell/All American Items 3 and 4: $972.00
Please note: Even though New York State Industries for the Disabled was not the lowest bidder

on items 1 and 2, we are required to award to them as a New York State Preferred Source, as
long as their bid is no more than 15% higher than the lowest bid.

SCHEDULE 18-E-423 - EXPLANATION OF BUDGETARY TRANSFERS
#T5,T6, T7 & T27

SCHEDULES 18-F-341 & 342 - CONTRACT REPORTS

SCHEDULE 9-H-18 - HOME TEACHING (regular & special

(confidential)
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SCHEDULE 9-S-18 - SPECIAL TRANSPORTATION (confidential)

SCHEDULE 9-SE-18 - COMMITTEE RECOMMENDATIONS

(confidential)
RECEIPT
OF Upon a motion by Mr. Centamore, seconded by Mrs. Rosales,

SCHEDULES the Board of Education approved the following Receipt of
Schedules collectively:

SCHEDULE 18-A-472 - TREASURER’s REPORT

Statement of Revenues - General Fund - August
School Lunch Fund August

Federal Fund - August

Claims Audit
Report August 1, 2018 - August 31, 2018

SCHEDULE 18-B-802 - APPROPRIATION BUDGET STATUS REPORT

Appropriation Budget Status Report  General Fund - August
Capital Fund - August
School Lunch Fund August
Federal Fund - August
Extra-Classroom Activities Funds Robert Frost - August
Deer Park High School - August

APPROVALS - All Fieldtrips listed below were approved:

> Varsity Girls Cross Country to Jackson, N] -9/28-9/29/18
> DECA Conference in Rochester, NY - 3/5-3/8/19
> DECA Conference in Orlando, FL - 4/26 -5/1/19

PUBLIC

BE Farah Bathony - transportation outside 15 mile limit to private school

HEARD Bruce Sander - 10/27 Pumpkin Chuck, purchasing energy efficient
A/C’s, keeping communication open with IT department
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QUESTIONS/COMMENTS/CONCERNS, Board of Education

Next meeting is October 9 Work Session

ADJOURN Upon a motion by Mr. Centamore, seconded by Mrs. Rosales, the
Board of Education adjourned at 8:20 p.m.
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